REVISED AMENDMENT D

ITEM 3.1 — SETTING THE COUNCIL TAX 2014.15 (see pages 94 - 106 of the main
agenda)

REVISED AMENDMENT D

Moved: Councillor James Barber
Seconded: Councillor David Hubber

To reflect an increase in the assumed council tax collection rate from 96.5% to 97.5%
- achievable now that the service has been brought in house — and a corresponding
1% reduction in the Southwark element of council tax for all residents:

In paragraph 2, delete ‘£1,211.14’ and insert ‘£1202.02’.

In paragraph 5, delete all occurrences of the figure ‘£1,211.14° and insert
‘£1202.02'.

In paragraph 17, delete the table and insert:

Authority Band D tax | Band D tax | Change
2013/14 2014/15 %
£ £
Southwark Council Tax 912.14 903.02 (1.00)
GLA Precept 303.00 299.00 (1.32)
Total Band D council tax 1,215.14 1,202.02 (1.08)

In paragraph 19, delete ‘£1,211.14’ and insert ‘£1,202.02’.

In paragraph 20, delete ‘£1,211.14’ and insert ‘£1,202.02’.



